Jinat Ansari

From: Priyanka Joshi <priyanka.joshi-c@perceptindia.in>
Sent: 18 September 2025 14:10

To: ‘Jinat Ansari'

Cc: ‘Sanchit Jambhale'

Subject: RE: Event Quotation

Attachments: AYUSH CATERERS CANCEL CHEQUE.JPG

From: Priyanka Joshi [mailto:priyanka.joshi-c@perceptindia.in]
Sent: 18 September 2025 14:09

To: 'Jinat Ansari'

Cc: 'Sanchit Jambhale'

Subject: FW: Event Quotation

From: Someshwar Rao Gunuganti [mailto:gsomurao@gmail.com]
Sent: 16 September 2025 16:52

To: priyanka.joshi-c@perceptindia.in

Subject: Event Quotation

Caution : This email has orginated from outside the organisation. Don't respond to the email OR click on
links OR open attactment unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear sir,

Please find the bill Quotation from Yashoda Hospital Somajiguda Canteen (AYUSH
CATERERS)

Double Non Veg Buffet Lunch For 20 Members

Per pax Rs:1,000

20*1000 =20,000

GST 5% :1,000

Grand total:21,000

Note : Prices are including Taxes

Event on : 19-09-2025

]
Lunch time: 1.00pm to 2.30pm

Account Details

M/S:Ayush caterers

C/A A/c1n0:9333444789

IFSC code: KKBK0000552

KOTAK MAHINDRA BANK RAJBHAVAN ROAD SOMAIJIGUDA
Mobile n0:9949944057

GST NO:36AEGPG2058G1ZQ



